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Abstract – With Facebook having over 1.31 billion active 

users worldwide, it is only logical that educators would 

consider integrating Facebook into education. This review 

article evaluates the factors educators should consider when 

planning to integrate Facebook in education. The factors 

evaluated in this article include the benefits and risks of using 

Facebook; the perception of teachers and students using 

Facebook as well as the psychological and social implications of 

Facebook on student engagement in learning. In all the 

research studies reviewed, results show that Facebook use in 

education was well received by students who were willing 

participants and that Facebook had enhanced their interest, 

motivation, learning attitude and engagement in learning. 

Facebook also has potential as a learning management system 

(LMS) as it has the required pedagogical, social and 

technological affordances for learning management. Even 

though the response toward using Facebook is positive in all 

the studies conducted, the instructor’s role to coordinate, 

facilitate and intervene in Facebook usage is crucial. In 

essence, educators must weigh the benefits and risks before 

integrating Facebook into their teaching and learning. 
Keywords – Facebook in education, benefits and risks, 

perception, implications, learning 

management system (LMS) 

 

I. INTRODUCTION 

Technology has transformed human interaction from snail 

mail, to e- mail and finally to social networking sites (SNSs) 

for instant communication. One of the many SNSs to have 

influenced global communication is Facebook. Facebook 

was ranked the most popular social networking site (SNS) 

with over 1.31 billion active users worldwide on its tenth 

birthday
[1]

. In Malaysia alone, there are over 13,589,520 

Facebook users 
[2]

. Due to its extensive user base and ease of 

access by people around the globe, there is potential in using 

Facebook for education. 
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With the immense popularity of Facebook, many educators 

have discovered that using Facebook  for  educational  

purposes  proves  beneficial  to  both  teachers  and  students 
[3] [4][5] [6] [7]

. However, there is also a growing controversy as 

some educators remain wary of its place in education 

claiming that SNSs may disengage students from learning 

traditional skills and literacies
[8]

. Other concerns are that 

Facebook integration will infringe on privacy and integrity;  

lack of integrity of student submissions and privacy concerns 

have been reported as being among barriers to Facebook 

integration 
[9]

. Moreover, Sickler
[10]

 discovered that students 

did not welcome the presence of faculty members as 

Facebook friends. Researchers have commented that there is a 

lack of solid empirical research on the overall value of 

Facebook in pedagogy 
[11] [12]

. Hence, the question remains: 

should Facebook be integrated into education?  

II. THE APPEAL OF FACEBOOK IN EDUCATION 

Facebook was launched by Mark Zuckerberg in February 
2004 as a social networking site, but with education as the 
focus. Membership then was exclusively for university 
students, but its popularity soon grew to include any person 
aged 13 and above with a valid email account. With such a 
grand mass of users, educators are beginning to realize the 
powerful potential of Facebook as a collaborative learning 
tool. Hence, the interest in Facebook as an educational tool 
became a popular research topic among educators. One of the 
main reasons educators are interested in Facebook is that 699 
million people are logging onto Facebook daily and spending 
an  average of 20 minutes per Facebook visit 

[13]
 According to 

online news portal
14] 

the Daily Tech 
(2013),  the Pew Internet & American Life Project (along with
Harvard‘s Berkman Center) found that 95 percent of teenagers 
aged 12-17 use the Internet, and from these figures, 94% of 
them have Facebook accounts. 

The user has the flexibility of controlling what is viewed in 
the user‘s timeline, which allows privacy to be respected. Now 
Facebook has a site dedicated solely for education and also 
hundreds of websites and applications to support education. 
Facebook also offers templates that help teachers get students 
interested and motivated tolearn. Teachers can use and 
incorporate many applications,such as Study Group, Quizlet, 
SAT quest, To Do List and Quizmasters into their pedagogy. 
These are among the top applications for educators rated by 
Jenkins. 

[15].
With all these applications to support education, it 

may prove to be advantageous to integrate Facebook in 
education. 
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III. THE BENEFITS OF USING FACEBOOK IN TEACHING 
AND LEARNING 

With the rapid development of Web 2.0 technologies,―our 
world has become flat‖

[16]
. We can now be instantly connected 

with each other through the World Wide Web via various 
types of electronic tool and gadget like the mobile phone, 
tablets, iPads, laptops and desktops. Technology has become 
part of our daily life and the younger generation known as 
―digital natives‖ to Prensky

[17]
 take to the Internet like a fish to 

water. The present society has become attached to various 
social media such as Viber, Wechat, Skype, Whatsapp, 
Twitter, Instagram and Facebook daily to keep connected with 
each other and the world. Facebook is a social networking 
service that was launched in February 2004 and its influence 
has spread like wildfire as it is widely used by people all 
around the world 

[18]
.  

The education field must stay abreast with the 
advancement and innovation of technology to suit the learning 
styles of students at this modern age.  Previously, 
communication and learning platform technologies such as 
email, chat rooms, bulletin board and Moodle

[19]
 were 

integrated to aid education.  As educators are focusing on 
using technology, pedagogy and content knowledge (TPACK) 
in teaching and learning, Facebook is an option to enhance 
learning outcomes. Selwyn (2007) found that Facebook has 
become the SNS of choice by college students with 85% of 
college students having a college network adopting Facebook 
[20]

 while Teclehaimanot and Hickman 
[21]

 further stated that 
students were willing to accept teachers using Facebook in 
education. 

Social networking encourages the development of 
transferable technical and social skills such as participation, 
production, communication and collaboration, which adds 
value to formal and informal learning 

[22]
. He and Wang 

[23]
 

showed that integrating social media into the learning 
environment could increase learners‘ satisfaction with the 
course, improving their learning and writing ability as well as 
fostering interaction. Ku, Lin and Tsai 

[24]
 concluded  that 

students‘ motivation to learn was improved via collaborative 
learning through social interaction activities performed using 
Facebook. Another study

[25]
 also discovered that learning 

outcomes improved tremendously when a Facebook group 
was created to assist students in learning the Chinese 
language. The Facebook group helped both teachers and 
students to provide positive interactions as well as organize 
learning activities and resources. To summarize these findings, 
Facebook provides a relaxed, friendly atmosphere that invites 
student engagement. When students feel engaged, 
collaboration and participation ultimately leads to learning 
outside of the classroom. 

Furthermore, teachers realize that they need to turn to SNS 

like Facebook to adapt to the learning styles of students
[26]

. 

With the growing influence of Facebook in education, The 

Education Foundation of the UK produced a Facebook 

guide for educators. The Facebook guide offers insight and 

practical advice on how social media can support traditional 

classroom learning, enable ―out of hours‖ learning, facilitate 

communication between educators, students and parents, 

and enhance digital skills and citizenship
[27]

. However, 

educators need to consider the findings of other researchers 

on the risks, perceptions and implications of using Facebook 

in education before making the decision to integrate 

Facebook into their pedagogy. 
 

IV. THE RISKS OF USING FACEBOOK IN TEACHING 
AND LEARNING 

Although Facebook has the potential to significantly 
revolutionize teaching and learning, educators also need to be 
aware of the risks associated with its use. One such risk 

[28]
 is 

the lack of control over the use of this application. Students or 
even the public may create or engage in inappropriate content 
or malicious behavior. These actions can have serious 
implications and undermine the credibility of the educator and 
the institution concerned.  

The greatest risk of Facebook usage is infringement of 
privacy. Studies show that students were very likely to post 
actual information in Facebook, such as birthday (96%), e-
mail address (85%), hometown (85%), and relationship status 
(81%) 

[29, 30, 31].
 Wildemuth 

[32]
 in 2008 further observed that 

users of SNSs such as Facebook seem either unconcerned 
about their privacy or unaware of the loss of privacy they 
suffer during their time online. By disclosing personal 
information on Facebook, students disregard the need for 
privacy and subject themselves to third party intrusion. These 
parties can use the information posted on Facebook for data 
mining, phishing, and other malicious purposes. For example, 
Jagatic et al. (2005) launched a phishing experiment using 
SNS to get information from selected students about their 
friends at Indiana University. The results show a 72 percent 
success rate of phishing within the social network as opposed 
to 16 percent within the control group

[33]
 . With privacy being 

the main issue, the views of teachers and students regarding 
Facebook in learning should be considered. 

V.  TEACHERS’ PERCEPTION OF FACEBOOK IN 
LEARNING 

Researchers have mixed views on teachers‘ perception of 
Facebook in education. DiVall and Kirwin

[34]
 found that 

educators who considered Facebook as a voluntary adjunct to 
teaching will be well received as many students were already 
Facebook users. They realized students were open to the idea 
of using this tool in their course as it could help bridge the gap 
between classroom theory and practice. However, another 
study by Morris and Millen

[35]
 found that teachers were not 

supportive of Facebook as they felt privacy, security and 
identity management would pose a problem. Another concern 
teachers voiced was that Facebook is a social networking 
platform and not an online learning platform such as Moodle. 
These teachers felt that the applications available in Facebook 
may be unable to support online learning. Moreover, data 
integrity issues may arise from Facebook use. Thomas and 
Thomas

[36] 
found that professors of higher institutions 

regarded Facebook as a ―young-person‘s game‖. As a result, it 
is often argued that Facebook is seen as an obstacle rather than 
an opportunity. 
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VI. STUDENTS’ PERCEPTION OF FACEBOOK IN 
LEARNING 

Student attitude toward Facebook has the strongest 
indication of student engagement in learning

[37][38]
. Hewitt and 

Forte
[39]

 found that interaction via Facebook has a positive 
impact on the students‘ perception of the professor with 66% 
(n = 136) feeling comfortable with teachers on Facebook. 
According to DiVall and Kirwin 

[40]
 (2012), 86% of students 

perceived Facebook use benefited their learning. Estus 
[41]

 also 
found that students thought Facebook application was easy to 
use and the assignment added value to the course. Students 
also felt satisfied with using Facebook as a learning 
management system

[42] 
as it could be easily implemented. 

Although, students welcomed using Facebook and that 
learning motivation via Facebook increased, learning 
achievement was not significantly improved 

[43]
. Another 

study
[44]

 also found that students preferred the Facebook 
interaction to be more passive to allow them more opportunity 
to learn from their teachers. Besides that, students did not feel 
Facebook provided privacy 

[45][46].
 

 VII THE PSYCHOLOGICAL IMPLICATIONS OF 
FACEBOOK IN LEARNING 

O‘Sullivan et al. (2004) found that students who viewed an 
instructor‘s website with high levels of mediated immediacy, 
including forms of self-disclosure, reported high levels of 
motivation and affective learning, indicating positive attitudes 
toward the course and the teacher

[47]
. This finding was 

validated by a number of research studies that found student 
motivation, affective learning, classroom climate and student-
faculty relationship increased when students accessed websites 
of teachers  with  high  level  of  positive  self-disclosure 
[48][49]

. In conclusion, motivation, satisfaction, positive student 
learning outcome and student engagement in learning can be 
positively correlated with the teacher‘s immediacy and self-
disclosure on Facebook. 

When DiVall and Kirwin (2012) investigated the use of 
Facebook as an alternative tool for learning compared with 
Blackboard, they found that students viewed Facebook as a 
valuable study tool that added to their learning

[50]
. Moreover, 

57% of these students actually said they would miss Facebook 
if its use was not continued in subsequent courses. However, 
Wang et al.

[51]
 stated that using Facebook seems to be more 

appropriate for young learners than adults and teachers who do 
not have to be students‘ friend on Facebook. 

VII. THE SOCIAL IMPLICATIONS OF USING FACEBOOK 
IN LEARNING 

Social networking sites such as Facebook provide 
individuals with a way of maintaining and strengthening social 
ties, which can be beneficial in both social and academic 
settings. However, these social sites also pose a danger to 
students‘ privacy, safety, and professional reputations if 
proper precautions are not taken. Hence, it is important to 
understand that issues of trust, risk, copyright, liability, and 
privacy may be as important as understanding how the Web 
works 

[52]
.  

It is clear that issues of privacy, safety and security need to 
be addressed by educators before considering Facebook 
integration into education. Students need to be educated about 
the risks associated with social networking services and issues 
of online privacy, potential dangers, responsibility for 
controlling access to online profiles, legal issues concerning 
libelous remarks and invasion of privacy

[53][54]
. Schools 

planning to use Facebook should have policies and guidelines 
for their students to be more socially responsible Facebook 
users. 

VIII. FACEBOOK AS A LEARNING MANAGEMENT 
SYSTEM 

Research shows that using LMSs have many benefits in 
teaching, such as allowing faculty to shift from content-based 
learning to process-based learning

[55]
. LMSs can also shift 

learning processes from passive to active
[56]

 and have the 
potential increase student enrollment

[57]
, besides promoting 

interaction between students and faculty members 
[58]

.  

However, using existing commercial LMSs such as 
Blackboard often entail practical constraints

[59]
 such as the 

high cost involved in purchase and maintenance. Besides that,  
trainee  teachers  cannot  access  certain  features  such  as  
creating  courses,  enrolling students and setting up student 
groups. Moreover, research also shows that learning a new 
system can be tedious and discouraging

[60]
. Facebook is free 

and can be used as a LMS. In the study conducted by DiVall 
and Kirwin (2012), 77% of students preferred to read and view 
posts on Facebook compared to Blackboard and statistics 
confirmed that Facebook was used more often than 
Blackboard

[61]
. 

In another study, Wang et al. (2012) found that Facebook 
group can be used as an LMS as it has certain pedagogical, 
social and technological affordances. Despite the limitations of 
Facebook in supporting the direct uploading of other format 
files, students were happy to share learning resources with the 
help of third-party applications. Students also found that 
organizing weekly learning activities using the event function 
to be meaningful in their learning

[62]
. 

It is most interesting to note that Blackboard created a new 
application called ―Blackboard sync‖ in the hope of reaching 
out to students using Facebook. Blackboard‘s strategy is to 
bring its services where the students already are and capitalize 
on Facebook's ubiquity and collaboration capabilities

[63]
. On 

the other hand, Moodle LMS responded with a re-configured 
home page to resemble Facebook in an adaptation known as 
Moodlebook, effectively importing Facebook to Moodle LMS. 
While, the (not well-known) London School of Business and 
Finance abandoned hybrids altogether and posted its ―free‖ 
on-line MBA curriculum on a Facebook Wall. It is undeniable 
that these organizations recognize Facebook as a potential 
LMS. 

 

IX. DISCUSSION AND CONCLUSION  

Facebook  was  originally  designed  as  an  online  social  
networking  site  and  the  debate continues as to whether it 
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should be integrated into teaching and learning. This article 
attempts to consolidate the many views and findings of 
different researches with their justifications. We must 
acknowledge that students keep changing their behavior with 
new technologies and that the generation gap between teacher 
and student is increasing over time. While students adapt and 
adopt new technologies almost instantly, teachers require more 
time to assimilate and familiarize themselves with the ever-
changing technology.  

The divide between teachers‘ perception and students‘ 
perception on Facebook cannot be ignored. Although  
Facebook  has  revolutionized  the  way  we  communicate,  
the  resistance  to incorporate it into teaching and learning is 
evident. However, teachers need to acknowledge that  their  
method  of  pedagogy  have  to  evolve  in  line  with  the  
generation  Z  students. Therefore, to embrace this need to 
keep up with developments in instructional technology, 
Thomas and Thomas (2012) suggested that educators should 
be trained in social media and Web 2.0 technologies to be able 
to embrace their importance and in development 

[64]
 . 

Facebook has many features and applications that can be 
adapted and used in education

[65]
 Moreover, it is a social 

network that has the largest following of users worldwide. It is 
no wonder that students welcome this technological tool as 
part of their learning. However, the concerns surrounding 
Facebook use in education are real

[66]
 and these includes issues 

such as privacy, safety, responsible usage of posting and 
discussion, including something so trivial as time spent on real 
learning. A summary of the factors teachers need to evaluate 
before integrating Facebook in their pedagogy is given in 
Figure 1.  

 

 
 

 

Figure 1. Summary of factors to evaluate when integrating 

Facebook in Education 

 
 

While not exhaustive, these factors when evaluating Facebook 
use in education are the most common in the literature 
reviewed,  and they provide some guidelines  to consider 
before integrating Facebook into the classroom. 
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